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Createspace. Paperback. Book Condition: New. This item is
printed on demand. Paperback. 82 pages. Dimensions: 11.0in. x
8.5in. x 0.2in.In April 1977, President Carter issued a
memorandum directing the review of federal dam safety
activities by an ad hoc panel of recognized experts. In June
1979, the ad hoc interagency committee on dam safety (ICODS)
issued its report, which contained the first guidelines for
federal agency dam owners. The Federal Guidelines for Dam
Safety (Guidelines) encourage strict safety standards in the
practices and procedures employed by the federal agencies or
required of dam owners regulated by the federal agencies. The
Guidelines address management practices and procedures but
do not attempt to establish technical standards. They provide
the most complete and authoritative statement available of the
desired management practices for promoting dam safety and
the welfare of the public. To supplement the Guidelines, ICODS
prepared and approved federal guidelines in the areas of
emergency action planning; earthquake analysis and design of
dams; selecting and accommodating inflow design floods for
dams; and glossary of terms. These publications, based on the
most current knowledge and experience available, provided
authoritative statements on the state of the art for these
important technical areas involving dam...
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I actually started reading this pdf. It can be rally exciting throgh reading period of time. Your lifestyle span is going to
be enhance as soon as you total reading this ebook.
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